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AUCTION RESULTS

Auction No : TCB/M/21 Auction Date : 05/FEB/2026

Scan to
VerifyMBINGA - 1,396 Bags | 83,762 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

1 LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/884/001/3795

F 4 27 267 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

No bid -

2 LIYOMBO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/851/009/3803

F 44 31 2,671 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

No bid -

3 LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/884/001/3796

TT 0 50 50 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

No bid -

4 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025-
2026/1190/003/3321

TT 3 52 232 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

200.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

5 LIYOMBO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/851/009/3804

TT 13 51 831 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

No bid -

6 LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/884/001/3797

AF 0 46 46 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

No bid -

7 LIYOMBO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/851/009/3805

AF 15 11 911 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

No bid -

8 LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/884/001/3798

C 7 52 472 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

No bid -

9} LIYOMBO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/851/009/3806

C 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

210.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

10} LIYOMBO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/851/009/3806

C 37 45 2,265 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

210.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

11 LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/884/001/3799

B 10 3 603 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

301.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

12 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025-
2026/1190/002/1707

B 38 1 2,281 DAE LTD 318.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

13) LIYOMBO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/851/009/3807

B 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

314.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

14) LIYOMBO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/851/009/3807

B 77 22 4,642 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

310.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

15 LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/884/001/3800

A 13 58 838 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

318.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

16 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025-
2026/1190/002/1708

A 75 56 4,556 DAE LTD 317.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

17] LIYOMBO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/851/009/3808

A 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

310.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

18] LIYOMBO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/851/009/3808

A 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

310.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

19] LIYOMBO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/851/009/3808

A 28 28 1,708 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

310.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

20 LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/884/001/3801

AA 21 4 1,264 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

315.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

21 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025-
2026/1190/002/1709

AA 96 50 5,810 DAE LTD 314.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
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22} LIYOMBO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/851/009/3809

AA 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

312.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

23} LIYOMBO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/851/009/3809

AA 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

312.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

24} LIYOMBO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/851/009/3809

AA 74 49 4,489 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

312.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

25 LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/884/001/3802

PB 6 40 400 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

315.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

26 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025-
2026/1190/003/3327

PB 56 13 3,373 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

317.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

27 LIYOMBO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/851/009/3810

PB 83 18 4,998 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

310.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

83 LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/884/004/1428

F 16 58 1,018 CMS LTD MBINGA No bid -

84 MKOHA AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/238/004/1553

F 2 51 171 CMS LTD MBINGA No bid -

85 Mkalanga Amcos LTD/2025-
2026/881/002/1561

F 1 0 60 CMS LTD MBINGA No bid -

86 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/002/3755

F 3 23 203 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

No bid -

87 LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/884/004/1427

TT 10 7 607 CMS LTD MBINGA No bid -

88 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/002/3756

TT 0 52 52 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

No bid -

89 NYASA KAHAWA PRODUCTION CO
LTD/2025-2026/1262/005/3708

TT 0 23 23 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

No bid -

90 LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/884/004/1426

AF 4 47 287 CMS LTD MBINGA No bid -

91 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/002/3757

AF 2 55 175 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

No bid -

92 Mkalanga Amcos LTD/2025-
2026/881/002/1559

AF 1 0 60 CMS LTD MBINGA No bid -

93 Mkalanga Amcos LTD/2025-
2026/881/002/1556

A 34 18 2,058 CMS LTD MBINGA 318.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

94 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/003/318 PB 2 19 139 KYEJU'S COFFEE CO
LTD MBINGA

No bid -

95 NGIMA AMCOS/2025-2026/216/001/1404 UG 1 52 112 CMS LTD MBINGA Withdrawn -

96 MOUNT LIPEMBE AGRICULTURE
LTD/2025-2026/1087/001/1146

UG 1 30 90 CMS LTD MBINGA No bid -

MOSHI MJINI - 715 Bags | 42,947 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

28 J & S PREMIUM PRODUCT (T)
LTD/2025-2026/1168/026, 2025-
2026/1168/019, 2025-2026/1168/020/999

F 4 14 254 TCCCO - MOSHI WH No bid -

29 USWAA MAMBA AMCOS/2025-
2026/1223/002/1491

F 4 25 265 GOURMET MOSHI 174.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

30 USWAA MAMBA AMCOS/2025-
2026/1223/002/1492

TT 2 36 156 GOURMET MOSHI 210.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

31 UDURU MAKOA RURAL COOPERATIVE
SOCIETY/2025-2026/1062/002, 2025-
2026/1062/002/955

C 3 40 220 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 233.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited
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32 Nkoanrua RCS Ltd/2025-2026/20/002/936 C 4 22 262 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 230.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

33 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society
Ltd/2025-2026/270/002, 2025-
2026/270/006, 2025-2026/270/005, 2025-
2026/270/007, 2025-2026/270/008, 2025-
2026/270/001, 2025-2026/270/003, 2025-
2026/270/004/37

C 3 20 200 City Coffee LTD Moshi
WH

252.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

34 LYAMUNGO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/1238/002/911

C 14 50 890 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 264.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

35 MOUNT MERU SPECIALITY COFFEE
GROWERS AMCOS/2025-
2026/1078/007, 2025-2026/1078/006,
2025-2026/1078/004, 2025-
2026/1078/005/951

C 8 47 527 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 265.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

36 Masama Roo Amcos Ltd/2025-
2026/276/004, 2025-2026/276/004/900

C 1 52 112 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 245.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

37 MANUSHI NARUMU COOPERATIVE
JOINT ENTERPRISE LIMETD/2025-
2026/971/003/931

C 26 50 1,610 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 272.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

38 USWAA MAMBA AMCOS/2025-
2026/1223/002/1493

C 7 56 476 GOURMET MOSHI 278.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

39 UKIKO COOPERATIVE JOINT
ENTERPRISE LTD/2025-2026/1278/002,
2025-2026/1278/003/895

C 7 22 442 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 259.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

40 Shari Speciality Coffee Group/2025-
2026/115/003/1568

AB 0 52 52 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

No bid -

41 Shari Speciality Coffee Group/2025-
2026/115/002/1566

AB 29 4 1,744 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

326.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

42 SING'ISI MERU RCS LTD/2025-
2026/993/001/1562

AB 28 51 1,731 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

329.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

43 USWAA MAMBA AMCOS/2025-
2026/1223/002/1495

AB 60 27 3,627 GOURMET MOSHI 327.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

44 Kyengia RCS Ltd/2025-
2026/304/001/1499

AB 11 35 695 GOURMET MOSHI 314.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

45 MANUSHI NARUMU COOPERATIVE
JOINT ENTERPRISE LIMETD/2025-
2026/971/003/930

AB 76 6 4,566 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 330.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

46 Nkoanrua RCS Ltd/2025-2026/20/002/934 AB 44 11 2,651 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 332.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

47 UDURU MAKOA RURAL COOPERATIVE
SOCIETY/2025-2026/1062/002/954

AB 19 45 1,185 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 331.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

48 MOUNT MERU SPECIALITY COFFEE
GROWERS AMCOS/2025-
2026/1078/007, 2025-2026/1078/007/947

AB 7 30 450 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 330.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

49 LYAMUNGO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/1238/002/909

AB 79 29 4,769 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 336.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

50 UKIKO COOPERATIVE JOINT
ENTERPRISE LTD/2025-2026/1278/002,
2025-2026/1278/003/893

AB 39 16 2,356 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 337.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

51 Shari Speciality Coffee Group/2025-
2026/115/002/1565

AA 8 52 532 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

336.00 Sold D & J DISTRIBUTORS
COMPANY LTD

52 SING'ISI MERU RCS LTD/2025-
2026/993/001/1561

AA 6 15 375 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

337.00 Sold D & J DISTRIBUTORS
COMPANY LTD
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53 USWAA MAMBA AMCOS/2025-
2026/1223/002/1496

AA 8 1 481 GOURMET MOSHI 336.00 Sold D & J DISTRIBUTORS
COMPANY LTD

54 Kyengia RCS Ltd/2025-
2026/304/001/1500

AA 3 16 196 GOURMET MOSHI 339.00 Sold D & J DISTRIBUTORS
COMPANY LTD

55 MANUSHI NARUMU COOPERATIVE
JOINT ENTERPRISE LIMETD/2025-
2026/971/003/928

AA 29 0 1,740 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 345.00 Sold D & J DISTRIBUTORS
COMPANY LTD

56 Nkoanrua RCS Ltd/2025-2026/20/002/933 AA 21 49 1,309 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 343.00 Sold D & J DISTRIBUTORS
COMPANY LTD

57 UDURU MAKOA RURAL COOPERATIVE
SOCIETY/2025-2026/1062/002/953

AA 9 2 542 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 341.00 Sold D & J DISTRIBUTORS
COMPANY LTD

58 MOUNT MERU SPECIALITY COFFEE
GROWERS AMCOS/2025-
2026/1078/007/948

AA 3 30 210 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 338.00 Sold D & J DISTRIBUTORS
COMPANY LTD

59 LYAMUNGO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/1238/002/908

AA 30 11 1,811 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 345.00 Sold D & J DISTRIBUTORS
COMPANY LTD

60 UKIKO COOPERATIVE JOINT
ENTERPRISE LTD/2025-2026/1278/002,
2025-2026/1278/003/892

AA 10 41 641 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 343.00 Sold D & J DISTRIBUTORS
COMPANY LTD

61 Shari Speciality Coffee Group/2025-
2026/115/002/1564

PB 4 10 250 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

328.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

62 SING'ISI MERU RCS LTD/2025-
2026/993/001/1560

PB 4 1 241 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

322.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

63 USWAA MAMBA AMCOS/2025-
2026/1223/002/1494

PB 6 41 401 GOURMET MOSHI 327.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

64 Kyengia RCS Ltd/2025-
2026/304/001/1498

PB 1 0 60 GOURMET MOSHI 313.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

65 MANUSHI NARUMU COOPERATIVE
JOINT ENTERPRISE LIMETD/2025-
2026/971/003/927

PB 10 42 642 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 328.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

66 Nkoanrua RCS Ltd/2025-2026/20/002/932 PB 5 23 323 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 330.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

67 UDURU MAKOA RURAL COOPERATIVE
SOCIETY/2025-2026/1062/002/952

PB 3 29 209 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 330.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

68 LYAMUNGO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/1238/002/907

PB 9 6 546 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 324.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

69 UKIKO COOPERATIVE JOINT
ENTERPRISE LTD/2025-2026/1278/002,
2025-2026/1278/003/891

PB 3 19 199 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 316.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

70 Shari Speciality Coffee Group/2025-
2026/115/002/1567

UG 6 37 397 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

No bid -

71 LYAMUNGO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/1238/002/910

UG 2 11 131 TCCCO - MOSHI WH No bid -

72 Shari Speciality Coffee Group/2025-
2026/115/003/1569

UG 0 47 47 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

206.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

73 UKIKO COOPERATIVE JOINT
ENTERPRISE LTD/2025-2026/1278/003,
2025-2026/1278/002, 2025-
2026/1278/002/941

UG 1 33 93 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 205.00 Sold KILIMANJARO COFFEE
DEALERS (1995) LTD

74 SING'ISI MERU RCS LTD/2025-
2026/993/001/1563

UG 4 9 249 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

No bid -

75 Nkoanrua RCS Ltd/2025-2026/20/002/935 UG 0 55 55 TCCCO - MOSHI WH No bid -

76 Kyengia RCS Ltd/2025-
2026/304/001/1497

UG 2 25 145 GOURMET MOSHI 211.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
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77 MANUSHI NARUMU COOPERATIVE
JOINT ENTERPRISE LIMETD/2025-
2026/971/003/929

UG 3 49 229 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 211.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

78 J & S PREMIUM PRODUCT (T)
LTD/2025-2026/1168/027/1000

UG 11 14 674 TCCCO - MOSHI WH No bid -

79 MOUNT MERU SPECIALITY COFFEE
GROWERS AMCOS/2025-
2026/1078/007, 2025-2026/1078/006,
2025-2026/1078/005, 2025-
2026/1078/002, 2025-2026/1078/004,
2025-2026/1078/003, 2025-
2026/1078/001, 2025-2026/1078/00

UG 5 0 300 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 211.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

80 J & S PREMIUM PRODUCT (T)
LTD/2025-2026/1168/026, 2025-
2026/1168/025, 2025-2026/1168/023,
2025-2026/1168/024, 2025-
2026/1168/022, 2025-2026/1168/021,
2025-2026/1168/019, 2025-
2026/1168/020/997

UG 4 23 263 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 215.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

81 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society
Ltd/2025-2026/270/005, 2025-
2026/270/002, 2025-2026/270/004, 2025-
2026/270/006, 2025-2026/270/008, 2025-
2026/270/003, 2025-2026/270/007, 2025-
2026/270/001/37

UG 6 56 416 City Coffee LTD Moshi
WH

230.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
SON LTD

DSM - 80 Bags | 4,853 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

82 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025-
2026/1190/001/15

PB 80 53 4,853 TCB DSM No bid -

Issued by : TCB SYSTEM
Date Issued : 2026-02-05 15:42:39
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