Tanzania Coffee Board

United Republic of Tanzania

COFPEE

AUCTION RESULTS

Auction No : TCB/M/20 Auction Date : 29/JAN/2026
MBINGA - 1,857 Bags | 111,447 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS || WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
1 MAGUU AMCOS/2025- F 29 58 1,798 | MBINGA COFFEE 200.00 No bid -
2026/239/003/3779 CURING
2} LIYOMBO AMCOS LTD/2025- F 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 200.00 No bid -
2026/851/008/3787 CURING
3} LIYOMBO AMCOS LTD/2025- F 30 56 1,856 | MBINGA COFFEE 200.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/851/008/3787 CURING
4 LIYOMBO AMCOS LTD/2025- TT 7 26 446 | MBINGA COFFEE 223.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/851/008/3788 CURING Limited
5 MAGUU AMCOS/2025- T 7 1 421 | MBINGA COFFEE 225.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/239/003/3780 CURING Limited
6 LIYOMBO AMCOS LTD/2025- AF 24 10 1,450 | MBINGA COFFEE 222.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/851/008/3789 CURING Limited
7 MAGUU AMCOS/2025- AF 16 4 964 | MBINGA COFFEE 222.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/239/003/3781 CURING LIMITED
8 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- C 28 57 1,737 | MBINGA COFFEE 330.00 No bid -
2026/1266/002/3275 CURING
9 MAGUU AMCOS/2025- © 80 0 4,800 | MBINGA COFFEE 280.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/239/003/3782 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
10 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- C 32 52 1,972 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/259 LTD MBINGA
11 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- B 46 48 2,808 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/261 LTD MBINGA
12 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- B 45 58 2,758 | MBINGA COFFEE 400.00 No bid -
2026/1266/002/3276 CURING
13) MAGUU AMCOS/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 350.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/239/003/3783 CURING LIMITED
14) MAGUU AMCOS/2025- B 0 30 30 | MBINGA COFFEE 350.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/239/003/3783 CURING LIMITED
15 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- A 96 44 5,804 | MBINGA COFFEE 400.00 No bid -
2026/1266/002/3277 CURING
16) MAGUU AMCOS/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 352.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/239/003/3784 CURING LIMITED
17) MAGUU AMCOS/2025- A 36 48 2,208 | MBINGA COFFEE 352.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/239/003/3784 CURING LIMITED
18] GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/262 LTD MBINGA
19] GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- A 99 41 5,981 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/262 LTD MBINGA
20] GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- A 18 36 1,116 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/262 LTD MBINGA
21) DAYB BEST COFFEE CO LTD/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 354.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/1288/001/3406 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
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22) DAYB BEST COFFEE CO LTD/2025- AA 38 57 2,337 | MBINGA COFFEE 354.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/1288/001/3406 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
23} GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- AA 99 41 5,981 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/263 LTD MBINGA
24} GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid =
2026/1266/003/263 LTD MBINGA
25} GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- AA 29 12 1,752 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/263 LTD MBINGA
26} GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 400.00 No bid =
2026/1266/002/3278 CURING
27} GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- AA 29 21 1,761 | MBINGA COFFEE 400.00 No bid -
2026/1266/002/3278 CURING
28] MAGUU AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 354.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/239/003/3785 CURING LIMITED
29] MAGUU AMCOS/2025- AA 64 25 3,865 | MBINGA COFFEE 354.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/239/003/3785 CURING LIMITED
30 DAYB BEST COFFEE CO LTD/2025- AAA 67 3 4,023 | MBINGA COFFEE 354.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/1288/001/3407 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
31 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- PB 14 20 860 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/260 LTD MBINGA
32 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- PB 27 5 1,625 | MBINGA COFFEE 400.00 No bid °
2026/1266/002/3279 CURING
33 MAGUU AMCOS/2025- PB 43 11 2,591 | MBINGA COFFEE 350.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/239/003/3786 CURING LIMITED
80 COTTI TANZANIA LIMITED/2025- F 10 47 647 | MBINGA COFFEE 150.00 No bid =
2026/1265/001/3153 CURING
81 DAYB BEST COFFEE CO LTD/2025- F 30 20 1,820 | MBINGA COFFEE 150.00 No bid =
2026/1288/001/3400 CURING
82 DAYB BEST COFFEE CO LTD/2025- B 0 36 36 | MBINGA COFFEE 345.00 No bid =
2026/1288/001/3404 CURING
IYUNGA MBEYA - 976 Bags | 58,560 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
34 Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- F 18 33 1,113 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 180.00 No bid :
2026/207/001/1590 WH
35 Nkunga AMCOS/2025-2026/209/001/1606 E 5 14 314 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 180.00 No bid =
WH
36 UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- F 9 0 540 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 180.00 No bid -
2026/210/001/1598 WH
41 Nkunga AMCOS/2025-2026/209/001/1605 TT 10 30 630 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 215.00 No bid =
WH
87 NDEMBELA AMCOS/2025- F 11 43 703 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 180.00 No bid -
2026/206/001/1819 WH
100} KASENGE AMCOS/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 350.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/108/001/1978 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
101} KASENGE AMCOS/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 356.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/108/001/1978 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
102} KASENGE AMCOS/2025- B 22 49 1,369 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 351.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/108/001/1978 WH LIMITED
105] KASENGE AMCOS/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 359.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/108/001/1977 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
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106] KASENGE AMCOS/2025- A 100 0 6,000 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 360.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/108/001/1977 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
107] KASENGE AMCOS/2025- A 15 40 940 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 357.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/108/001/1977 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
110) KASENGE AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 359.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/108/001/1976 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
111) KASENGE AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 356.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/108/001/1976 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
112) KASENGE AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 360.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/108/001/1976 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
113) KASENGE AMCOS/2025- AA 57 29 3,449 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 355.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/108/001/1976 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
116] KASENGE AMCOS/2025- PB 100 0 6,000 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 362.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/108/001/1975 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
117] KASENGE AMCOS/2025- PB 20 38 1,238 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 356.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/108/001/1975 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
118 Kyobo AMCOS Ltd/2025- UG 4 24 264 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 190.00 No bid -
2026/208/003/1751 WH
KYERWA - 985 Bags | 59,102 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
37 ANYANDWILE COMPANY F 9 52 592 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 180.00 No bid -
LIMITED/2025-2026/854/002/2293 Company LTD
38 WELLU Il AMCOS Ltd/2025- F 15 4 904 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 180.00 No bid -
2026/49/001/2284 Company LTD
39 COTTI TANZANIA LIMITED/2025- F 0 54 54 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 180.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/1265/002/2151 Company LTD Limited
40 WELLU Il AMCOS Ltd/2025- TT 6 9 369 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 215.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/49/001/2282 Company LTD Limited
42 ANYANDWILE COMPANY TT 8 23 503 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 215.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
LIMITED/2025-2026/854/002/2291 Company LTD Limited
43 COTTI TANZANIA LIMITED/2025- T 0 33 33 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 215.00 No bid -
2026/1265/002/2149 Company LTD
44 COTTI TANZANIA LIMITED/2025- AF 0 24 24 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 220.00 No bid -
2026/1265/002/2150 Company LTD
45 WELLU Il AMCOS Ltd/2025- AF 6 52 412 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 229.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/49/001/2283 Company LTD Limited
46 ANYANDWILE COMPANY AF 6 45 405 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 220.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
LIMITED/2025-2026/854/002/2292 Company LTD Limited
47 WELLU Il AMCOS Ltd/2025- E 3 11 191 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 224.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/49/001/2285 Company LTD Limited
48 ANYANDWILE COMPANY E 4 16 256 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 222.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
LIMITED/2025-2026/854/002/2294 Company LTD Limited
49 WELLU Il AMCOS Ltd/2025- © 8 11 491 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 225.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/49/001/2286 Company LTD Limited
50 ANYANDWILE COMPANY C 6 43 403 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 228.00 No bid -
LIMITED/2025-2026/854/002/2295 Company LTD
51 WELLU Il AMCOS Ltd/2025- B 22 11 1,331 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 320.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/49/001/2287 Company LTD TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
52 ANYANDWILE COMPANY B 18 30 1,110 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 321.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN

LIMITED/2025-2026/854/002/2296

Company LTD

(TANZANIA) LIMITED
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53 WELLU Il AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 14 57 897 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 320.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/49/001/2288 Company LTD TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
54 ANYANDWILE COMPANY A 13 49 829 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 338.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
LIMITED/2025-2026/854/002/2297 Company LTD (TANZANIA) LIMITED
55 WELLU Il AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 13 28 808 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 330.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/49/001/2289 Company LTD TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
56 ANYANDWILE COMPANY AA 12 46 766 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 339.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
LIMITED/2025-2026/854/002/2298 Company LTD (TANZANIA) LIMITED
57 WELLU Il AMCOS Ltd/2025- PB 10 9 609 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 322.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/49/001/2290 Company LTD LTD
58 ANYANDWILE COMPANY PB 10 37 637 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 339.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
LIMITED/2025-2026/854/002/2299 Company LTD (TANZANIA) LIMITED
59 TANZANIA COFFEE BOARD/2025- UG 3 11 191 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 224.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/942/001/2281 Company LTD
83) NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- F 100 0 6,000 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 180.00 No bid -
2026/323/005/2318 Company LTD
84) NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- F 62 42 3,762 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 140.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/323/005/2318 Company LTD LIMITED
85 NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- F 22 47 1,367 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 180.00 No bid -
2026/323/004/2311 Company LTD
88 IBWEKYELA AMCOS LTD/2025- F 51 48 3,108 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 180.00 No bid -
2026/1173/002/2302 Company LTD
89 NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- TT 68 0 4,080 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 205.00 No bid -
2026/323/005/2317 Company LTD
90 NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- TT 8 0 480 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 207.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/323/004/2309 Company LTD Limited
91 IBWEKYELA AMCOS LTD/2025- TT 23 11 1,391 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 208.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/1173/002/2300 Company LTD Limited
92 NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- AF 3 17 197 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 210.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/323/004/2310 Company LTD Limited
93 IBWEKYELA AMCOS LTD/2025- AF 28 32 1,712 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 215.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/1173/002/2301 Company LTD Limited
94 IBWEKYELA AMCOS LTD/2025- E 4 25 265 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 215.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/1173/002/2303 Company LTD Limited
95 NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- C 16 33 993 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 231.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/323/004/2312 Company LTD Limited
96 IBWEKYELA AMCOS LTD/2025- © 37 52 2,272 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 294.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/1173/002/2304 Company LTD Limited
97 NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- B 49 0 2,940 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 334.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/323/004/2313 Company LTD TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
98} IBWEKYELA AMCOS LTD/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 331.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/1173/002/2305 Company LTD (TANZANIA) LIMITED
99} IBWEKYELA AMCOS LTD/2025- B 18 41 1,121 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 333.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/1173/002/2305 Company LTD TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
103 NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- A 27 53 1,673 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 322.00 No bid -
2026/323/004/2314 Company LTD
104 IBWEKYELA AMCOS LTD/2025- A 69 47 4,187 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 336.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/1173/002/2306 Company LTD (TANZANIA) LIMITED
108 NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- AA 15 4 904 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 332.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/323/004/2315 Company LTD LIMITED
109 IBWEKYELA AMCOS LTD/2025- AA 44 7 2,647 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 335.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/1173/002/2307 Company LTD TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

Page 4 of 6 | Auction : TCB/M/20

Printed On : 2026-02-02 13:22:36



114 NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- PB 6 47 407 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 320.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/323/004/2316 Company LTD LIMITED
115 IBWEKYELA AMCOS LTD/2025- PB 29 41 1,781 | Mbozi Coffee Curing 320.00 No bid -
2026/1173/002/2308 Company LTD
MOSHI MJINI - 272 Bags | 16,339 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS [POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
60 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED C 9 56 596 | City Coffee LTD Moshi 225.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025- WH Limited
2026/1224/033/367
62 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED AB 21 40 1,300 | City Coffee LTD Moshi 330.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025- WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
2026/1224/033/366
61 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED AB 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Moshi 329.00 No bid -
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025- WH
2026/1224/033/366
63 AFRICADO LTD/2025- AB 2 37 157 | RAFIKI COFFEE LTD 330.00 No bid =
2026/1291/003/1523 MOSHI WH
64 AFRICADO LTD/2025- AB 3 52 232 | RAFIKI COFFEE LTD 350.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1291/002/1522 MOSHI WH LIMITED
65 AFRICADO LTD/2025- AB 5 36 336 | RAFIKI COFFEE LTD 350.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1291/001/1519 MOSHI WH LIMITED
66 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED AA 46 47 2,807 | City Coffee LTD Moshi 330.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025- WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
2026/1224/033/365
67 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED PB 21 16 1,276 | City Coffee LTD Moshi 320.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025- WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
2026/1224/033/364
68 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED UG 30 52 1,852 | City Coffee LTD Moshi 221.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025- WH Limited
2026/1224/033/368
69 AFRICADO LTD/2025-2026/1291/002, UG 0 54 54 | RAFIKI COFFEE LTD 90.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
2025-2026/1291/003/1520 MOSHI WH SON LTD
70 AFRICADO LTD/2025- UG 0 58 58 | RAFIKI COFFEE LTD 145.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
2026/1291/001/1518 MOSHI WH SON LTD
119 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society F 1 5 65 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 150.00 No bid -
Ltd/2025-2026/270/004/890
120 BLUE MOUNTAIN COFFEE AB 23 3 1,383 | RAFIKI COFFEE LTD 290.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
FARMS/2025-2026/910/012, 2025- MOSHI WH LTD
2026/910/012, 2025-2026/910/012, 2025-
2026/910/012/1336
121 HORTANZIA LTD/2025- UG 1 30 90 | RAFIKI COFFEE LTD 193.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/1248/002/1093 MOSHI WH LTD
122 BLUE MOUNTAIN COFFEE UG 2 13 133 | RAFIKI COFFEE LTD 80.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
FARMS/2025-2026/910/005, 2025- MOSHI WH SON LTD
2026/910/011/1338
Njiro-Arusha - 294 Bags | 17,698 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
71 EDELWEISS OLDEANI ESTATES AB 10 4 604 | ARUSHA COFFEE MILL 215.00 No bid -
LTD/2024-2025/1002/004, 2024- LTD WH
2025/1002/013, 2024-2025/1002/012,
2024-2025/1002/009, 2024-
2025/1002/011, 2024-2025/1002/005,
2024-2025/1002/004, 2024-
2025/1002/013, 2024-2025/
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72

EDELWEISS OLDEANI ESTATES
LTD/2024-2025/1002/004, 2024-
2025/1002/013, 2024-2025/1002/012,
2024-2025/1002/009, 2024-
2025/1002/011, 2024-2025/1002/005,
2024-2025/1002/004, 2024-
2025/1002/013, 2024-2025/

AB

53 15 3,195 | ARUSHA COFFEE MILL

LTD WH

250.00

No bid

73

EDELWEISS OLDEANI ESTATES
LTD/2024-2025/1002/004, 2024-
2025/1002/013, 2024-2025/1002/012,
2024-2025/1002/009, 2024-
2025/1002/011, 2024-2025/1002/005,
2024-2025/1002/004, 2024-
2025/1002/013, 2024-2025/

AB

65 44 ARUSHA COFFEE MILL

LTD WH

3,944

315.00

Sold

DRK General Merchants
Limited

74

EDELWEISS OLDEANI ESTATES
LTD/2024-2025/1002/004, 2024-
2025/1002/013, 2024-2025/1002/012,
2024-2025/1002/009, 2024-
2025/1002/011, 2024-2025/1002/005,
2024-2025/1002/004, 2024-
2025/1002/013, 2024-2025/

AB

24 18 1,458 | ARUSHA COFFEE MILL

LTD WH

250.00

Sold

DRK General Merchants
Limited

75

FINAGRO PLANTATIONS LTD/2024-
2025/1160/022, 2024-2025/1160/022,
2024-2025/1160/019, 2024-
2025/1160/025, 2024-2025/1160/003,
2024-2025/1160/004, 2024-
2025/1160/006, 2024-2025/1160/012,
2024-2025/1160/0

AB

ARUSHA COFFEE MILL
LTD WH

270.00

Sold

DRK General Merchants
Limited

76

FINAGRO PLANTATIONS LTD/2024-
2025/1160/022, 2024-2025/1160/022,
2024-2025/1160/019, 2024-
2025/1160/025, 2024-2025/1160/003,
2024-2025/1160/004, 2024-
2025/1160/006, 2024-2025/1160/012,
2024-2025/1160/0

AB

31 49 ARUSHA COFFEE MILL

LTD WH

1,909

232.00

Sold

DRK General Merchants
Limited

77

EDELWEISS OLDEANI ESTATES
LTD/2024-2025/1002/004, 2024-
2025/1002/013, 2024-2025/1002/012,
2024-2025/1002/009, 2024-
2025/1002/011, 2024-2025/1002/005,
2024-2025/1002/004, 2024-
2025/1002/013, 2024-2025/

AB

37 31 ARUSHA COFFEE MILL

LTD WH

2,251

225.00

Sold

DRK General Merchants
Limited

78

EDELWEISS OLDEANI ESTATES
LTD/2024-2025/1002/009/327

16 33 993 | ARUSHA COFFEE MILL

LTD WH

215.00

No bid

79

FINAGRO PLANTATIONS LTD/2024-
2025/1160/022, 2024-2025/1160/022,
2024-2025/1160/019, 2024-
2025/1160/025, 2024-2025/1160/003,
2024-2025/1160/004, 2024-
2025/1160/006, 2024-2025/1160/012,
2024-2025/1160/0

AB

48 44 ARUSHA COFFEE MILL

LTD WH

2,924

221.00

Sold

DRK General Merchants
Limited

SONGWE - 6 Bags | 417 Kgs

LOT NO.

DESCRIPTION

GRADE

BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE

PRICE

STATUS

BUYER

86

MAULA AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/258/001/602

6 57 417 | CMS LTD MBOZI

180.00

No bid

Issued by :
Date Issued :

TCB SYSTEM
2026-02-02 13:22:36
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