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Scan to
VerifyMBINGA - 484 Bags | 29,077 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

1 LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/884/004/1428

F 16 58 1,018 CMS LTD MBINGA 150.00 No bid -

2 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/002/3755

F 3 23 203 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

155.00 No bid -

3 NYASA KAHAWA PRODUCTION CO
LTD/2025-2026/1262/001/1526

F 4 46 286 CMS LTD MBINGA 163.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

4 AFAD COFFEE COMPANY
LIMITED/2025-2026/1287/001/1412

F 2 47 167 CMS LTD MBINGA 158.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

5 NYASA KAHAWA PRODUCTION CO
LTD/2025-2026/1262/005/3707

F 2 36 156 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

158.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

6 LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/884/004/1427

TT 10 7 607 CMS LTD MBINGA 205.00 No bid -

7 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/002/3756

TT 0 52 52 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

205.00 No bid -

8 NYASA KAHAWA PRODUCTION CO
LTD/2025-2026/1262/001/1525

TT 2 47 167 CMS LTD MBINGA 205.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

9 NYASA KAHAWA PRODUCTION CO
LTD/2025-2026/1262/005/3708

TT 0 23 23 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

205.00 No bid -

10 LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/884/004/1426

AF 4 47 287 CMS LTD MBINGA 210.00 No bid -

11 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/002/3757

AF 2 55 175 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

210.00 No bid -

12 NYASA KAHAWA PRODUCTION CO
LTD/2025-2026/1262/001/1524

AF 3 21 201 CMS LTD MBINGA 219.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

13 NYASA KAHAWA PRODUCTION CO
LTD/2025-2026/1262/005/3709

AF 2 44 164 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

210.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

14 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/002/3758

C 4 54 294 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

230.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

15 NYASA KAHAWA PRODUCTION CO
LTD/2025-2026/1262/001/1523

C 14 42 882 CMS LTD MBINGA 250.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

16 NYASA KAHAWA PRODUCTION CO
LTD/2025-2026/1262/005/3710

C 10 38 638 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

278.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

17 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/002/3759

B 9 13 553 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

335.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

18 NYASA KAHAWA PRODUCTION CO
LTD/2025-2026/1262/001/1522

B 50 42 3,042 CMS LTD MBINGA 340.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

19 NYASA KAHAWA PRODUCTION CO
LTD/2025-2026/1262/005/3711

B 10 47 647 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

340.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
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20 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/002/3760

A 11 52 712 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

322.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

21 NYASA KAHAWA PRODUCTION CO
LTD/2025-2026/1262/001/1521

A 53 12 3,192 CMS LTD MBINGA 347.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

22 NYASA KAHAWA PRODUCTION CO
LTD/2025-2026/1262/005/3712

A 15 48 948 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

349.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

23 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/002/3761

AA 18 23 1,103 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

341.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

24} NYASA KAHAWA PRODUCTION CO
LTD/2025-2026/1262/001/1520

AA 100 0 6,000 CMS LTD MBINGA 350.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

25} NYASA KAHAWA PRODUCTION CO
LTD/2025-2026/1262/001/1520

AA 15 15 915 CMS LTD MBINGA 346.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

26 NYASA KAHAWA PRODUCTION CO
LTD/2025-2026/1262/005/3713

AA 60 32 3,632 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

354.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

27 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/002/3762

PB 2 48 168 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

332.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

28 NYASA KAHAWA PRODUCTION CO
LTD/2025-2026/1262/001/1519

PB 31 36 1,896 CMS LTD MBINGA 350.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

29 NYASA KAHAWA PRODUCTION CO
LTD/2025-2026/1262/005/3714

PB 10 33 633 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

353.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

30 NGIMA AMCOS/2025-2026/216/001/1404 UG 1 52 112 CMS LTD MBINGA 220.00 No bid -

31 MOUNT LIPEMBE AGRICULTURE
LTD/2025-2026/1087/001/1146

UG 1 30 90 CMS LTD MBINGA 220.00 No bid -

53 COTTI TANZANIA LIMITED/2025-
2026/1265/001/1282

TT 1 54 114 CMS LTD MBINGA 202.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

MOSHI MJINI - 178 Bags | 10,689 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

32 BLOCK AND BOCHA LTD/2025-
2026/909/008/1442

C 7 21 441 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

263.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

33 BLUE MOUNTAIN COFFEE
FARMS/2025-2026/910/015, 2025-
2026/910/012/1440

C 3 38 218 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

252.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

34 BLOCK AND BOCHA LTD/2025-
2026/909/014, 2025-2026/909/013, 2025-
2026/909/004/1460

C 10 55 655 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

280.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

35 BLUE MOUNTAIN COFFEE
FARMS/2025-2026/910/011, 2025-
2026/910/017, 2025-2026/910/001, 2025-
2026/910/005/1446

C 6 52 412 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

280.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

36 BLUE MOUNTAIN COFFEE
FARMS/2025-2026/910/015/1439

B 3 25 205 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

250.00 Sold KILIMANJARO COFFEE
DEALERS (1995) LTD

37 BLUE MOUNTAIN COFFEE
FARMS/2025-2026/910/015/1438

A 1 48 108 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

250.00 Sold KILIMANJARO COFFEE
DEALERS (1995) LTD

38 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025-
2026/1224/032/362

AB 13 50 830 City Coffee LTD Moshi
WH

340.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

39 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025-
2026/1224/032/361

AA 6 35 395 City Coffee LTD Moshi
WH

346.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
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40 BLUE MOUNTAIN COFFEE
FARMS/2025-2026/910/015/1437

AA 1 43 103 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

260.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

41 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025-
2026/1224/032/360

PB 2 24 144 City Coffee LTD Moshi
WH

320.00 No bid -

42 BLUE MOUNTAIN COFFEE
FARMS/2025-2026/910/015/1436

PB 1 38 98 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

256.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

43 BLOCK AND BOCHA LTD/2025-
2026/909/008/1443

UG 17 49 1,069 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

100.00 Sold KILIMANJARO COFFEE
DEALERS (1995) LTD

44 BLUE MOUNTAIN COFFEE
FARMS/2025-2026/910/015, 2025-
2026/910/012/1441

UG 9 44 584 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

80.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
SON LTD

45 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025-
2026/1224/032/363

UG 7 59 479 City Coffee LTD Moshi
WH

180.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

46 BLUE MOUNTAIN COFFEE
FARMS/2025-2026/910/017, 2025-
2026/910/011, 2025-2026/910/001, 2025-
2026/910/005/1454

UG 13 29 809 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

181.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

47 BLOCK AND BOCHA LTD/2025-
2026/909/014, 2025-2026/909/004, 2025-
2026/909/013/1466

UG 16 22 982 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

183.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

48 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025-
2026/1224/031/357

UG 1 54 114 City Coffee LTD Moshi
WH

181.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

49 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025-
2026/1224/028/349

UG 8 51 531 City Coffee LTD Moshi
WH

191.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

50 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025-
2026/1224/027/344

UG 1 23 83 City Coffee LTD Moshi
WH

218.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

51 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025-
2026/1224/021, 2025-2026/1224/023,
2025-2026/1224/022, 2025-
2026/1224/024, 2025-2026/1224/018,
2025-2026/1224/020, 2025-
2026/1224/019, 2025-202

UG 5 56 356 City Coffee LTD Moshi
WH

261.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

52 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025-
2026/1224/030/355

UG 18 44 1,124 City Coffee LTD Moshi
WH

302.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

58 Uru Kati Mawela AMCOS/2025-
2026/140/001/1266

F 3 2 182 GOURMET MOSHI 155.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

59 SIHA KIYEYO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/263/006/1344

AB 0 52 52 GOURMET MOSHI 200.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
SON LTD

60 SIHA KIYEYO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/263/006/1345

AA 0 11 11 GOURMET MOSHI 200.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
SON LTD

61 SIKIRARI AMCOS/2025-
2026/243/001/1326

AA 2 56 176 GOURMET MOSHI 342.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

62 Uru Kati Mawela AMCOS/2025-
2026/140/001/1269

PB 5 38 338 GOURMET MOSHI 340.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

63 SIHA KIYEYO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/263/006/1343

PB 0 12 12 GOURMET MOSHI 200.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
SON LTD

64 SIKIRARI AMCOS/2025-
2026/243/001/1324

PB 1 51 111 GOURMET MOSHI 340.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

65 SIHA KIYEYO AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/263/006/1342

UG 1 7 67 GOURMET MOSHI 100.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
SON LTD
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SONGWE - 218 Bags | 13,116 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

54 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025-
2026/1190/001/518

F 3 47 227 CMS LTD MBOZI 155.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

55 MAULA AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/258/002/779

F 14 51 891 CMS LTD MBOZI 140.00 No bid -

56) MAULA AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/258/002/782

B 99 59 5,999 CMS LTD MBOZI 337.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

57) MAULA AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/258/002/782

B 99 59 5,999 CMS LTD MBOZI 331.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
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